

CP1314 Bid Tabulations **Award valid 4/16/13.** Use current CP1213 award for ordering

Items	Case Count	Flatt Stationers	Quill	My Office Products	Henderson QC	Kadosh
1. Bond/Duplicating	39917	\$25.85	NO BID	\$26.00	NO BID	NO BID
2. Bond/ Duplicating	293	\$36.10	\$49.80	\$36.94	NO BID	NO BID
3. Bond/Duplicating	225	\$28.55	\$78.80	\$29.47	NO BID	NO BID
4. Bond/Duplicating	40	\$28.55	\$39.40	\$29.47	NO BID	NO BID
5. Bond Paper	13	\$58.30	\$63.60	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
6. Bond Paper	106	\$36.90	\$42.90	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
7. Bond Paper	97	\$36.90	\$42.90	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
8. Bond Paper	116	\$36.90	\$42.90	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
9. Bond Paper	10	\$36.90	\$42.90	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
10. Bond Paper	35	\$36.90	NO BID	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
11. Bond Paper	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
12. Bond Paper	10	\$36.90	NO BID	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
13. Bond Paper	10	\$36.90	\$63.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
14. Bond Paper	95	\$36.90	\$42.90	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
15. Bond Paper	10	\$36.90	\$42.90	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
16. Bond Paper	10	\$36.90	NO BID	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
17. Bond Paper	50	\$36.90	NO BID	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
18. Bond Paper	117	\$36.90	\$42.90	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
19. Bond Paper	5	NO BID	\$59.20	\$48.88	NO BID	NO BID
20. Bond Paper	5	\$75.00	\$74.00	\$68.10	NO BID	NO BID
21. Text Paper	5	NO BID	NO BID	\$63.92	NO BID	NO BID
22. Parchment	5	NO BID	NO BID	\$49.50	NO BID	NO BID
23. Parchment	5	NO BID	\$45.40	\$49.50	NO BID	NO BID
24. Parchment	5	NO BID	\$36.32	\$48.50	NO BID	NO BID
25. Parchment	5	\$75.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
26. Vellum	0	NO BID	\$75.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
27. Vellum	0	\$75.00	NO BID	\$69.80	NO BID	NO BID
28. Vellum	0	\$75.00	NO BID	\$69.80	NO BID	NO BID
29. Cover	5	\$34.80	\$80.08	\$49.10	NO BID	NO BID
30. Cover	5	\$60.00	\$64.80	\$69.80	NO BID	NO BID
31. Cover	5	\$60.00	\$64.80	\$69.80	NO BID	NO BID
32. Cover	5	\$60.00	\$64.80	\$69.80	NO BID	NO BID
33. Cover	5	\$60.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
34. Cover	5	\$60.00	NO BID	\$69.80	NO BID	NO BID
35. Cover	5	\$60.00	\$64.80	\$69.80	NO BID	NO BID
36. Cover	5	\$60.00	\$64.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
37. Cover	5	\$64.80	\$64.80	\$69.80	NO BID	NO BID
38. Cover	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
39. Cover	5	NO BID	\$81.68	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
40. Cover	5	\$36.40	NO BID	\$49.50	NO BID	NO BID
41. NCR	0	NO BID	\$62.64	\$184.50	NO BID	NO BID
42. NCR	0	NO BID	\$74.85	\$207.50	NO BID	NO BID
43. NCR	0	NO BID	NO BID	\$411.20	NO BID	NO BID
44. NCR	0	NO BID	\$279.47	\$221.50	NO BID	NO BID
45. NCR	0	NO BID	NO BID	\$227.50	NO BID	NO BID
47. Vellum	0	\$45.53	\$54.72	\$49.50	NO BID	NO BID
48. Vellum	5	\$43.50	\$60.40	\$43.00	NO BID	NO BID
49. Railroad	1	\$48.00	\$77.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Details		No Minimum	Lift gate charges on pallet orders	No Minimum		

CP1314 Bid Tabulations **Award valid 4/16/**

Items	Case Count	Curtis 1000	Western BWR	Contract Paper	OK Paper
1. Bond/Duplicating	39917	NO BID	\$25.25 -\$29.00	\$29.15	\$37.35
2. Bond/ Duplicating	293	NO BID	\$40.40	\$40.52	\$50.05
3. Bond/Duplicating	225	NO BID	\$32.45	\$32.57	\$39.33
4. Bond/Duplicating	40	NO BID	\$32.45	\$32.57	\$39.35
5. Bond Paper	13	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$43.00
6. Bond Paper	106	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.27	\$43.00
7. Bond Paper	97	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.27	\$43.00
8. Bond Paper	116	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.27	\$43.00
9. Bond Paper	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.27	\$43.00
10. Bond Paper	35	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.27	\$43.00
11. Bond Paper	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
12. Bond Paper	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.27	\$43.00
13. Bond Paper	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.27	\$58.70
14. Bond Paper	95	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.27	\$43.00
15. Bond Paper	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.27	\$43.00
16. Bond Paper	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.27	\$43.00
17. Bond Paper	50	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.27	\$43.00
18. Bond Paper	117	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$43.00
19. Bond Paper	5	NO BID	\$52.56	NO BID	\$49.95
20. Bond Paper	5	NO BID	\$68.75	NO BID	\$49.95
21. Text Paper	5	NO BID	\$37.80	NO BID	\$72.08
22. Parchment	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$81.80
23. Parchment	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$81.80
24. Parchment	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$81.80
25. Parchment	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$81.80
26. Vellum	0	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
27. Vellum	0	NO BID	\$68.75	NO BID	\$74.75
28. Vellum	0	NO BID	\$68.75	NO BID	\$74.75
29. Cover	5	NO BID	\$52.12	NO BID	\$59.24
30. Cover	5	NO BID	\$70.59	NO BID	\$59.24
31. Cover	5	NO BID	\$70.59	NO BID	\$59.24
32. Cover	5	NO BID	\$70.59	NO BID	\$59.24
33. Cover	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$59.24
34. Cover	5	NO BID	\$70.59	NO BID	\$59.24
35. Cover	5	NO BID	\$70.59	NO BID	\$59.24
36. Cover	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$59.24
37. Cover	5	NO BID	\$52.15	NO BID	\$53.78
38. Cover	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$128.32
39. Cover	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$80.98
40. Cover	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$53.78
41. NCR	0	NO BID	\$79.15	NO BID	\$208.65
42. NCR	0	NO BID	\$88.75	NO BID	\$234.60
43. NCR	0	NO BID	\$112.00	NO BID	\$298.05
44. NCR	0	NO BID	\$94.60	NO BID	\$250.65
45. NCR	0	NO BID	\$97.80	NO BID	\$257.70
47. Vellum	0	NO BID	\$49.55	NO BID	\$37.62
48. Vellum	5	NO BID	\$47.20	NO BID	\$35.52
49. Railroad	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Details			Minimum delivery requirements	Minimum delivery requirements	Minimum order requirements