

	CASE COUNT	CONTRACT PAPER	VERITIV	FLATT	OLMSTEAD KIRK
01. Bond Paper Plain Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", Letter Size, 92 Bright White, 20 Lb, Case 5,000 Sheets	26,627	26.25	23.60 GP #10312748	24.61 Boise Copy	32.65 IP Xerographic
02. Bond Paper Plain 14 Paper, 8 1/2" x 14", Legal Size, 92 Bright White, 20 Lb, Case of 5,000 Sheets.	281	60.00	49.50 GP #10284020	36.00 Boise	45.80 IP Relay MP
03. Bond Paper Plain 17 Paper, 11" x 17", Ledger Size, 92 Bright White, 20 Lb, Case 2,500 Sheets	166	54.00	39.50 GP #10312751	28.00 Boise	36.00 IP Relay
04. Bond Paper 3 Hole Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", Letter Size, 3-Hole Drilled, 92 Bright, White, 20 Lb, Case of 5,000 sheets.	50	54.00	\$ 39.50 per case GP #10312753	28.00 Boise	36.00 IP Relay
05. Bond Paper Red 20# weight, red, 8 1/2" x 11", multi-purpose, 5,000 spc.	45	50.00	Boise	61.00 24# Roman Candle Red	50.00 Cherry Hammermill
06. Bond Paper Pink 20# weight, pink, 8 1/2" x 11", multi-purpose, 5,000 spc.	118	50.00	Boise	38.00 Boise Fireworx Pastel	50.00 Hammermill
07. Bond Paper Green 20# weight, green, 8 1/2" x 11", multi-purpose, 5,000 spc.	123	50.00	Boise	38.00 Boise Fireworx Pastel	50.00 Hammermill
08. Bond Paper Blue 20# weight, blue, 8 1/2" x 11", multi-purpose, 5,000 spc.	123	50.00	Boise	38.00 Boise Fireworx Pastel	50.00 Hammermill
09. Bond Paper Canary 20# weight, canary, 8 1/2" x 11", multi-purpose, 5,000 spc.	118	50.00	Boise	38.00 Boise Fireworx Pastel	50.00 Hammermill
10. Bond Paper Goldenrod 20# weight, goldenrod, 8 1/2" x 11", multi-purpose, 5,000 spc.	112	50.00	Boise	38.00 Boise Fireworx Pastel	50.00 Hammermill
11. Cover White Cover, White, 8 1/2" x 11" 65 lb, 2,000 spc.	433			36.00 67# Springhill	40.34 67# Springhill

	CASE COUNT	CONTRACT PAPER	VERITIV	FLATT	OLMSTEAD KIRK
12. Cover 17 Cover, White, 11" x 17" 65 lb, 1,000 spc.	101			38.00 Springhill 67#	42.45 Springhill 67#
13. Cover Blue Cover, Blue, 8 1/2" X 11" 65 lb, 2,000 spc.	31			38.00 Springhill 67#	42.42 Springhill 67#
14. Cover Canary Cover, Canary, 8 1/2" X 11" 65 lb, 2,000 spc.	29			38.00 Springhill 67#	42.42 Springhill 67#
15. Cover Purple Cover, Purple, 8 1/2" X 11" 65 lb, 2,500 spc.	28			60.00 Planetary Purple	42.42 67# Springhill 2,000/case
16. NCR 2 Part Wh/Ye NCR-Carbonless, 2-part, White/Yellow, 8 1/2" x 11" 20.5 lb, 2500 Sets per case	6			105.00 Excel One \$0.042/set	189.65 NCR Superior
17. NCR 3 Part Wh/Ye/Pi NCR-Carbonless, 3-part, White/Yellow/Pink, 8 1/2" x 11" 20.5 lb, 1670 Sets per case	11			120.00 Excel One \$0.072/set	273.50 NCR Superior
		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30 Bid # CP1718	Net 30 Full Cartons Only
Lowest Price (including shipping) Highlighted					
					<p>Minimum \$1,000.00 for prepaid freight. Order less than \$1,000.00 you pay freight. Minimum order \$450.00. Call for truckload orders. Price good through July 31, 2017. Thereafter all increases will be applied.</p>

	CASE COUNT	WWWTERA	QUILL	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	WESTERN BRW	TK SALES
01. Bond Paper Plain Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", Letter Size, 92 Bright White, 20 Lb, Case 5,000 Sheets	26,627	GPC999705	37.22 32.90 CT BID-720700CT			
02. Bond Paper Plain 14 Paper, 8 1/2" x 14", Legal Size, 92 Bright White, 20 Lb, Case of 5,000 Sheets.	281	GPC999706	49.04 43.91 CT BID-720223CT			
03. Bond Paper Plain 17 Paper, 11" x 17", Ledger Size, 92 Bright White, 20 Lb, Case 2,500 Sheets	166	GPC999812	38.52 52.13 CT BID-7201117CT			
04. Bond Paper 3 Hole Paper, 8 1/2" x 11", Letter Size, 3-Hole Drilled, 92 Bright, White, 20 Lb, Case of 5,000 sheets.	50	SNANMP113HP 97 Bright, 1103	42.12 38.30 CT BID-7203HP \$3.83			
05. Bond Paper Red 20# weight, red, 8 1/2" x 11", multi-purpose, 5,000 spc.	45	MOW471608	61.70 68.50 CT BID-722441 \$6.85			
06. Bond Paper Pink 20# weight, pink, 8 1/2" x 11", multi-purpose, 5,000 spc.	118	HAM103382CT Recycled	63.88 52.30 CT BID-720567 \$5.23			
07. Bond Paper Green 20# weight, green, 8 1/2" x 11", multi-purpose, 5,000 spc.	123	UNV11203, 1109	49.98 52.30 CT BID-720561 \$5.23			
08. Bond Paper Blue 20# weight, blue, 8 1/2" x 11", multi-purpose, 5,000 spc.	123	UNV11202, 1109	49.98 52.30 CT BID-720559 \$5.23			
09. Bond Paper Canary 20# weight, canary, 8 1/2" x 11", multi-purpose, 5,000 spc.	118	UNV11201	49.98 52.30 CT BID-720563 \$5.23			
10. Bond Paper Goldenrod 20# weight, goldenrod, 8 1/2" x 11", multi-purpose, 5,000 spc.	112	UNV11205	49.98 52.30 CT BID-720565 \$5.23			
11. Cover White Cover, White, 8 1/2" x 11" 65 lb, 2,000 spc.	433	67# Springhill	85.43 NO BID			

	CASE COUNT	WWWTERA	QUILL	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	WESTERN BRW	TK SALES
12. Cover 17 Cover, White, 11" x 17" 65 lb, 1,000 spc.	101	180.00	NO BID			
13. Cover Blue Cover, Blue, 8 1/2" X 11" 65 lb, 2,000 spc.	31	71.00	39.28 CT BID-81042 67#			
14. Cover Canary Cover, Canary, 8 1/2" X 11" 65 lb, 2,000 spc.	29	65.80	41.28 BID-81044 67#			
15. Cover Purple Cover, Purple, 8 1/2" X 11" 65 lb, 2,500 spc.	28	NO BID	77.44 BID-22871 Purple			
16. NCR 2 Part Wh/Ye NCR-Carbonless, 2-part, White/Yellow, 8 1/2" x 11" 20.5 lb, 2500 Sets per case	6	74.38	NO BID			
17. NCR 3 Part Wh/Ye/Pi NCR-Carbonless, 3-part, White/Yellow/Pink, 8 1/2" x 11" 20.5 lb, 1670 Sets per case	11	76.85	NO BID			
Lowest Price (including shipping) Highlighted		Net 30 Bid # CP1718 2% 10	Net 30 Bid #17-14838 \$25 Assisted Unloading Fee. Tailgate delivery. Liftgate request available.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid